
ITEM
Evergreen Lawn 

Care
Murphy 

Excavating
TA Gaddis

Morris & James 
Construction

Wedding 
Excavating

Yeiser Excavating
Lovins Concrete 

Construction
Redline 

Contracting
First Impressions

Supreme 
Enterprises

Cox Excavating
MC Coleman dba 
Property Scope

1 3507 Baybrook St: 1,000 sq. ft. on concrete slab 9,465.00$          3,500.00$          4,200.00$          5,250.00$          4,945.00$          6,475.00$          9,250.00$          7,500.00$          3,900.00$          17,571.00$        4,500.00$          22,990.00$        
2 618 Bolivar St:  1,200 sq. ft. on post and pillar 13,220.00$        5,375.00$          8,600.00$          No bid 13,400.00$        No bid No bid No bid 8,500.00$          12,000.00$        4,600.00$          26,950.00$        
3 736 Cedar S: 1,100 sq. ft. on post and pillar, 150 sq. ft. cellar 9,230.00$          3,725.00$          6,400.00$          No bid 8,895.00$          4,950.00$          No bid 10,500.00$        6,500.00$          19,821.00$        5,050.00$          27,250.00$        
4 612 Hall St: 1,000 sq. ft. on post and pillar 8,025.00$          3,500.00$          4,800.00$          No bid 4,145.00$          6,800.00$          8,500.00$          7,250.00$          4,100.00$          10,000.00$        3,900.00$          19,975.00$        
5 614 Hall St: +-200 sq. ft. accessory structures only 1,400.00$          1,500.00$          5,800.00$          No bid 625.00$             combined with above No bid 1,500.00$          No bid 2,000.00$          800.00$             6,600.00$          
6 715 Hall St: 1,000 sq. ft. on post and pillar 9,071.00$          3,275.00$          4,800.00$          No bid 4,345.00$          6,650.00$          8,250.00$          7,250.00$          6,100.00$          10,000.00$        3,900.00$          23,400.00$        

7

1604 J R Miller Blvd: 600 sq. ft. on post and pillar, +-400 sq. ft. other 
sheds, abatement of small amount of ACM to coincide with demo with EPA 
approval

13,990.00$        3,500.00$          5,800.00$          No bid 4,275.00$          5,650.00$          No bid No bid No bid 26,571.00$        3,900.00$          26,890.00$        

8
2318 Pardon Ave: 900 sq. ft. on post and pillar, abatement of ACM to 
coincide with demo with EPA approval 9,939.00$          3,500.00$          5,800.00$          No bid 4,495.00$          6,000.00$          No bid No bid No bid 24,371.00$        2,250.00$          18,185.00$        

9 807 Poindexter St: 800 sq. ft. on post and pillar 6,725.00$          2,800.00$          4,000.00$          No bid 3,445.00$          4,920.00$          9,500.00$          7,500.00$          2,900.00$          8,000.00$          3,800.00$          16,980.00$        
10 1523 W 4th St: 1,600 sq. ft. on brick foundation 12,620.00$        4,175.00$          6,800.00$          7,200.00$          8,745.00$          5,550.00$          12,800.00$        No bid 6,200.00$          24,371.00$        5,800.00$          28,500.00$        
11 2210 W 9th St: 700 sq. ft. on post and pillar 9,001.00$          2,500.00$          4,000.00$          No bid 2,945.00$          5,050.00$          6,200.00$          5,500.00$          2,900.00$          7,000.00$          3,600.00$          16,990.00$        
12 2424 W 9th St: 1,0000 sq. ft. on post and pillar 10,046.00$        2,800.00$          5,200.00$          No bid 4,345.00$          5,050.00$          8,000.00$          7,500.00$          4,500.00$          10,000.00$        3,900.00$          21,975.00$        

13 825 W 13th St: 900 sq. ft. on post and pillar, +-600 sq. ft. other sheds 11,110.00$        4,650.00$          7,100.00$          No bid 6,445.00$          5,650.00$          11,000.00$        8,500.00$          6,100.00$          15,000.00$        4,800.00$          28,650.00$        

14 914 E 21st St: 950 sq. ft. on brick foundation, +-450 sq. ft. garage 11,480.00$        5,550.00$          6,200.00$          No bid 11,499.00$        5,800.00$          12,000.00$        9,250.00$          6,900.00$          16,800.00$        5,300.00$          29,975.00$        
15 919 Cedar St: 1,100 sq. ft. on block foundation 12,392.00$        4,500.00$          6,000.00$          No bid 13,445.00$        7,350.00$          No bid No bid 6,900.00$          13,200.00$        4,800.00$          28,750.00$        

16
1604 E 4th St: 1,750 sq. ft. commercial structure concrete slab, spread 
footings 14,640.00$        4,800.00$          6,000.00$          7,875.00$          5,995.00$          5,000.00$          14,500.00$        8,500.00$          5,800.00$          37,821.00$        6,300.00$          32,450.00$        

TOTAL ITEMS #1-#16: 162,354.00$         59,650.00$           91,500.00$           20,325.00$           101,989.00$         80,895.00$           100,000.00$         80,750.00$           71,300.00$           254,526.00$         67,200.00$           376,510.00$         
Addenda: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Only #1 Yes Yes Yes

Exceptions: None None None None None None None None None None None None
Subconstractors: None None None None None None None None None None None None

Bid Security: Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes

BID #4410

Bid Opening: 3:00 PM December 19, 2024
OPENED BY: Kalyn Fox
TABULATED BY: Whitney McFarland
OBSERVERS: Joe Sublett, City of Owensboro; Stephen Franklin, City of Owensboro; Shelena Cox, Cox Exvacating; Kim Gilliam, Murphy 
Ecavating; Brian Milling, MC Coleman Group; John Hauser, 1st Impressions; Megan Mischel, 1st Impressions; Barbara Gaddis, TA 
Gaddis; Heath Stone, Redline; Todd West, Evergreen 

DEMOLITION OF STRUCTURES


