
Item # Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days) Item # Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days)

1 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab F250/Ford 54,902.10$   54,902.10$   60-90 days 1 1 ¾ Ton Extended Cab 57,459.00$   57,459.00$     160 days
OPTIONS: OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator -$              -$              Heavy duty alternator -$              -$                
Running boards 445.00$        445.00$        Running boards 250.00$        250.00$          
Low-profile safety warning light bar 680.50$        680.50$        Low-profile safety warning light bar 790.68$        790.68$          
4 safety warning thin mount strobe lights 696.00$        696.00$        4 safety warning thin mount strobe lights 724.80$        724.80$          
>10K GVWR upgrade package 100.00$        100.00$        >10K GVWR upgrade package 100.00$        100.00$          
4x4 -$              -$              4x4 2,762.00$     2,762.00$       
3rd set of keys 300.00$        300.00$        3rd set of keys 250.00$        250.00$          

ITEM 1 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 57,123.60$   57,123.60$   ITEM 1 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 62,336.48$   62,336.48$     

2 1 ½ ton 4x4 pickup extended cab Ford/F150 43,251.50$   43,251.50$   2 1 ½ ton 4x4 pickup extended cab 45,448.00$   45,448.00$     160 days
OPTIONS: OPTIONS:
Running boards 250.00$        250.00$        Running boards 250.00$        250.00$          
Plastic drop-in bed liner 350.00$        350.00$        Plastic drop-in bed liner 350.00$        350.00$          
3rd set of keys 300.00$        300.00$        3rd set of keys 250.00$        250.00$          
75-gallon L-shaped diesel fuel transfer tank 
and pump installed in truck bed 2,603.68$     2,603.68$     

75-gallon L-shaped diesel fuel transfer 
tank and pump installed in truck bed 1,882.69$     1,882.69$       

Low-profile safety warning light bar 989.29$        989.29$        Low-profile safety warning light bar 790.68$        790.68$          
4 safety warning thin mount strobe lights 841.23$        841.23$        4 safety warning thin mount strobe lights 724.80$        724.80$          

ITEM 2 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 48,585.70$   48,585.70$   ITEM 2 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 49,696.17$   49,696.17$     

3 1 Explorer Ford/Explorer 39,266.50$   39,266.50$   60-90 days 3 1 Explorer 39,687.00$   39,687.00$     180 days
OPTIONS: OPTIONS:
4x4 standard standard 4x4 2,200.00$     2,200.00$       
10" touchscreen display standard standard 10" touchscreen display -$              -$                
3rd set of keys 300.00$        300.00$        3rd set of keys 250.00$        250.00$          
Heated seats standard standard Heated seats -$              -$                

ITEM 3 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 39,566.50$   39,566.50$   ITEM 3 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 42,137.00$   42,137.00$     

4 1 ½ ton 4x4 pickup crew cab Ford/F150 44,916.50$   44,916.50$   60-90 days 4 1 ½ ton 4x4 pickup crew cab 46,536.00$   46,536.00$     160 days
OPTIONS: OPTIONS:
Running boards 250.00$        250.00$        Running boards 250.00$        250.00$          
Plastic drop-in bed liner No bid, incompatible w/ spray Plastic drop-in bed liner 350.00$        350.00$          
Spray in bed liner 550.00$        550.00$        Spray in bed liner 595.00$        595.00$          
Retractable tonneau bed cover No bid Retractable tonneau bed cover 2,641.00$     2,641.00$       
Tow mirrors No bid, no longer factory option Tow mirrors NA NA
Upfitter switches No bid, no longer factory option Upfitter switches 700.00$        700.00$          
Mobile office package No bid, no longer factory option Mobile office package 1,195.00$     1,195.00$       
3rd set of keys 300.00$        300.00$        3rd set of keys 250.00$        250.00$          

ITEM 4 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 46,016.50$   46,016.50$   ITEM 4 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 52,517.00$   52,517.00$     

5 1 ¾ ton crew cab Ford/F250 51,854.50$   51,854.50$   60-90 days 5 1 ¾ ton crew cab 53,843.00$   53,843.00$     160 days
OPTIONS: OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $0, no upcharge Heavy duty alternator -$              -$                
LED bed lights NA NA LED bed lights 400.00$        400.00$          
Running boards 445.00$        445.00$        Running boards 445.00$        445.00$          
Hard folding tonneau bed cover 1,200.00$     1,200.00$     Hard folding tonneau bed cover 1,750.00$     1,750.00$       
Upfitter switches in cab 165.00$        165.00$        Upfitter switches in cab 165.00$        165.00$          
3rd set of keys 300.00$        300.00$        3rd set of keys 250.00$        250.00$          

ITEM 5 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 53,964.50$   53,964.50$   ITEM 5 TOTAL WITH ALL OPTIONS: 56,853.00$   56,853.00$     

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED: NO ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED: NO
EXCEPTIONS: YES EXCEPTIONS: YES

BID SECURITY: NA BID SECURITY: NA
SUBCONTRACTORS NA SUBCONTRACTORS NA

Bid Opening: 3:00 PM October 31, 2024
OPENED BY: Kalyn Fox
TABULATED BY: Whitney McFarland
OBSERVERS: Stephen Franklin, City of Owensboro; Davis Alexander, Mid 
Tenn Ford

BID #4407
MULTIPLE VEHICLES

VENDOR: Sternberg FordVENDOR: Mid Tenn Ford REVISED 11.6.24


