
BID #4382

Bid Opening: 2:30 PM February 29, 2024
OPENED BY: Kalyn Fox
TABULATED BY: Maddie Coleman      

Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price

1 15,000 tons
Dense Grade 

Aggregate  $             20.00  $                 300,000.00 

2 500 tons
No. 8 Stone

 $             27.50  $                   13,750.00 

3 100 tons
No. 11 Stone

 $             24.20  $                     2,420.00 

4 100 tons
No. 3 Stone

 $             24.00  $                     2,400.00 

5 1,500 tons
No. 57 Stone 

 $             23.05  $                   34,575.00 

6 100 tons
Rip Rap

 $             25.50  $                     2,550.00 

7 500 tons
Course Natural 

Sand  $             14.70  $                     7,350.00 

8 200 tons
Natural Sand (Fine)

 $             22.00  $                     4,400.00 

9 500 tons
Special Backfill 

Sand  $             14.70  $                     7,350.00 

10 1 Mile
One Way Haul 

Distance                   5.00  $                   18,500.00 
*

 $                 393,295.00 

* Price configured by Method of Award equation on bid document page 9. 

Rock Sand and Backfill

Observers: Renae Mattingly ‐ Yager Materials, John McBride ‐ 

Castlen, Greg Armstrong ‐ Meuth Concrete, Jack Goetz ‐ City of 

Owenbsoro 

VENDOR: Castlen Terminals

Total Bid

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGED: NA

EXCEPTIONS: No

SUBCONTRACTORS: No



Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price

1 15,000 tons
Dense Grade 

Aggregate
 $             20.50  $    307,500.00 

2 500 tons No. 8 Stone  $             26.75  $      13,375.00 

3 100 tons No. 11 Stone  $             13.00  $        1,300.00 

4 100 tons No. 3 Stone  $             22.50  $        2,250.00 

5 1,500 tons No. 57 Stone  $             22.60  $      33,900.00 

6 100 tons Rip Rap  $             32.00  $        3,200.00 

7 500 tons Course Natural Sand  $             16.40  $        8,200.00 

8 200 tons Natural Sand (Fine)  $             19.10  $        3,820.00 

9 500 tons Special Backfill Sand  $             15.85  $        7,925.00 

10 1 Mile
One Way Haul 

Distance
                  3.00  $      11,100.00 

*

 $    392,570.00 Total Bid

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGED: NA

EXCEPTIONS: Yes

SUBCONTRACTORS: No

* Price configured by Method of Award equation on bid document page 9. 

VENDOR: Yager



Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Total Price

1 15,000 tons
Dense Grade 

Aggregate
 $             26.22  $    393,300.00 

2 500 tons No. 8 Stone  $             28.50  $      14,250.00 

3 100 tons No. 11 Stone  NO BID  NO BID 

4 100 tons No. 3 Stone  $             26.22  $        2,622.00 

5 1,500 tons No. 57 Stone  $             28.50  $      42,750.00 

6 100 tons Rip Rap  $             57.00  $        5,700.00 

7 500 tons
Course Natural 

Sand
 NO BID  NO BID 

8 200 tons Natural Sand (Fine)  NO BID  NO BID 

9 500 tons
Special Backfill 

Sand
 NO BID  NO BID 

10 1 Mile
One Way Haul 

Distance
 NO BID  NO BID 

 $    458,622.00 

** Bid submission was rejected due to bidder not submitting bid on all items for lump 

sum bid. 

VENDOR: GREEN DREAM **

Total Bid

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGED: NA

EXCEPTIONS: NO

SUBCONTRACTORS: NO


