BID #4370

Multiple Vehicles

Bid Opening: 3:00 PM December 7, 2023

OPENED BY: Kalyn Fox Observers: Stephen Franklin - City of Owensboro, Landan Jones - Jerry Ray Davis, Tim Meyers- McCluskey
TABULATED BY:Maddie Coleman

VENDOR: McCluskey Chevrolet

Item #

Quantity

Description

Make/Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Delivery (Days)

2 Ton 4x4 Pick-up Extended Cab
OPTIONS:

Running boards

V8 engine

Plastic drop-in bed liner

3rd set of keys

Extended warranty

2 ton 4x4 pickup extended cab
OPTIONS:

Running boards

V8 engine

Plastic drop-in bed liner

3rd set of keys

Extended warranty

Y4 ton crew cab
OPTIONS:

Heavy duty alternator
Running boards

Plastic drop in bed liner
Agate black camper shell
3rd set of keys

Extended warranty

Y4 ton extended cab
OPTIONS:

Heavy duty alternator
Running boards

Plastic drop in bed liner
4x4

3rd set of keys
Extended Warranty

2024 Chevy Silverado 1500 $ 45

,570.00

$ 45,570.00

20-60 Days

$

895.00

NO BID

$

600.00

$ 5

,400.00

NO BID

2023 Chevy Silverado 1500 $ 51

,992.00

$ 51,992.00

20-60 Days

Included

Included

$

600.00

$

500.00

NO BID

2024 Chevy Silverado 2500
4x4 Gas Black $ 54

,750.00

$ 54,750.00

20-60 Days

865.00

600.00

50.00

NO BID

$

$

NO BID

$

NO BID
NO BID NO BID

NO BID

Item #

Quantity

Description

HEE

Make/Model

Unit Price

Total Price

Delivery (Days)

% ton extended cab
OPTIONS:

Running boards
3rd set of keys
Extended warranty

1 ton crew cab
OPTIONS:
Running boards
Spray in bed liner
3rd set of keys
Extended warranty

1 ton regular cab
OPTIONS:

Heavy duty alternator
Running boards

3rd set of keys
Extended warranty

Cargo Van

OPTIONS:

Invertor to charge cordless power tools
General service upfit package

Class 4 hitch

3rd set of keys

Extended warranty

2024 Chevy Silverado 2500
w/ Service Body $

68,

751.00

$ 68,751.00

30-60 Days

895.00

500.00

$
$
NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGED

il

EXCEPTIONS

NA
Yes |




VENDOR: Frankfort Ford
Item # [Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days)
1 1 % Ton 4x4 Pick-up Extended Cab 2024 Ford F150 Ext Cab $ 41,086.00 | $ 41,086.00 [ 120 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 228.00 [ $ 228.00
V8 engine $ 1,246.00 [ $ 1,246.00
Plastic drop-in bed liner $ 319.00 [ $ 319.00
3rd set of keys $ 225.00 [ $ 225.00
Extended warranty $ 2,210.00 | $ 2,210.00
2 1 % ton 4x4 pickup extended cab 2024 Ford F150 Ext Cab $ 40,142.00 | $ 40,142.00 | 120 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 228.00 | $ 228.00
V8 engine $ 1,246.00 | $ 1,246.00
Plastic drop-in bed liner $ 319.00 [ $ 319.00
3rd set of keys $ 225.00 [ $ 225.00
Extended warranty $ 2,210.00 | $ 2,210.00
3 1 % ton crew cab 2024 Ford F250 Crew $ 47,739.00 | $ 47,739.00 |120 Days
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ 78.00 | $ 78.00
Running boards $ 405.00 | $ 405.00
Plastic drop in bed liner $ 542.00 [ $ 542.00
Agate black camper shell NO BID NO BID
3rd set of keys $ 225.00 [ $ 225.00
Extended warranty $ 2,585.00 | $ 2,585.00
4 1 ¥ ton extended cab 2024 Ford F250 Ext Cab $ 46,416.00 | $ 46,416.00 |120 Days
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ 78.00 | $ 78.00
Running boards $ 405.00 | $ 405.00
Plastic drop in bed liner $ 542.00 [ $ 542.00
4x4 INCLUDED INCLUDED
3rd set of keys $ 225.00 [ $ 225.00
Extended Warranty $ 2,585.00 | $ 2,585.00
Item # [Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days)
5 1 % ton extended cab 2024 Ford F250 Ext Cab $ 58,013.00 | $ 58,013.00 |120 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards 405.00 | $ 405.00
3rd set of keys 225.00 [ $ 225.00
Extended warranty 2,585.00 | $ 2,585.00
6 1 1 ton crew cab Ford F350 Dual Wheel $ 53,217.00 | $ 53,217.00 |120 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 405.00 | $ 405.00
Spray in bed liner $ 550.00 | $ 550.00
3rd set of keys $ 225.00 [ $ 225.00
Extended warranty $ 2,678.00 | $ 2,678.00
GET CLARIFICATION
7 2 1 ton regular cab 2024 Ford F350 Cab Steel Bed | § 60,889.00 | $ 121,778.00
OPTIONS: Get Clarification
Heavy duty alternator $ 250.00 | $ 500.00
Running boards $ 291.00 [ $ 582.00
3rd set of keys $ 225.00 [ $ 450.00
Extended warranty $ 2,975.00 | $ 5,950.00
8 1 Cargo Van 2024 Ford Transit Cargo $ 44,304.00 | $ 44,304.00 | 120 Days
OPTIONS:
Invertor to charge cordless power tools $ 433.00 | $ 433.00
General service upfit package $ 2,366.00 | $ 2,366.00
Class 4 hitch $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
3rd set of keys $ 225.00 [ $ 225.00
Extended warranty $ 2,846.00 | $ 2,846.00
ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGED
EXCEPTIONS Yes |




VENDOR: Jerry Ray Davis CDJR

Item # [Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days)

1 1 % Ton 4x4 Pick-up Extended Cab Ram 1500 Tradesman $ 51,390.00 | $ 54,055.00 | 30 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 499.00 | $ 499.00
V8 engine $ 3,045.00 | $ 3,045.00
Plastic drop-in bed liner $ 349.00 [ $ 349.00
3rd set of keys $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Extended warranty $ 3,295.00 | $ 3,295.00

2 1 % ton 4x4 pickup extended cab Ram 1500 Tradesman $ 51,390.00 | $ 54,055.00 | 30 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 499.00 | $ 499.00
V8 engine $ 3,045.00 | $ 3,045.00
Plastic drop-in bed liner $ 349.00 [ $ 349.00
3rd set of keys $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Extended warranty $ 3,295.00 | $ 3,295.00

3 1 % ton crew cab Ram 2500 Tradesman Crew $ 67,951.00 | $ 76,689.00 |30 Days
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ 399.00 | $ 399.00
Running boards $ 845.00 [ $ 845.00
Plastic drop in bed liner $ 349.00 [ $ 349.00
Agate black camper shell $ 3,400.00 | $ 3,400.00
3rd set of keys $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
Extended warranty $ 3,495.00 | $ 3,495.00

4 1 ¥ ton extended cab Ram 2500 Tradesman Crew $ 67,951.00 | $ 73,289.00 [30 Days
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ 399.00 | $ 399.00
Running boards $ 845.00 | $ 845.00
Plastic drop in bed liner $ 349.00 [ $ 349.00
4x4 $ - $ -
3rd set of keys $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Extended Warranty $ 3,495.00 | $ 3,495.00

Item # [Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days)

5 1 ¥ ton extended cab Ram 2500 Tradesman Crew $ 67,951.00 | $ 72,541.00 [30 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 845.00 | $ 845.00
3rd set of keys $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Extended warranty $ 3,495.00 | $ 3,495.00

6 1 1 ton crew cab Ram 3500 Crew $ 68,530.00 | $ 72,774.00 [30 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 845.00 | $ 845.00
Spray in bed liner $ 499.00 | $ 499.00
3rd set of keys $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Extended warranty $ 3,495.00 | $ 3,495.00

7 2 1 ton regular cab Ram 3500 Regular $ 70,830.00 | $ 75,819.00 |30 Days
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ 399.00 | $ 399.00
Running boards $ 845.00 | $ 845.00
3rd set of keys $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Extended warranty $ 3,495.00 | $ 3,495.00

8 1 Cargo Van Ram 3500 Promaster $ 52,960.00 | $ 64,004.00 | In Stock, Immediate
OPTIONS:
Invertor to charge cordless power tools $ 450.00 | $ 450.00
General service upfit package $ 6,000.00 | $ 6,000.00
Class 4 hitch $ 1,299.00 | $ 1,299.00
3rd set of keys $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
Extended warranty $ 3,295.00 | $ 3,295.00

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGED

NA

EXCEPTIONS

Yes




VENDOR: BF EVANS FORD

ltem # [Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days)

1 1 % Ton 4x4 Pick-up Extended Cab Ford F150 $ 4597450 $ 45,974.50 | 120 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
V8 engine $ 1,370.00 | $ 1,370.00
Plastic drop-in bed liner $ 445.00 | $ 445.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 327.00
Extended warranty $ 3,015.00 | $ 3,015.00

2 1 ¥ ton 4x4 pickup extended cab Ford F150 $ 46,249.00 | $ 46,249.00 | 120 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
V8 engine $ 1,370.00 | $ 1,370.00
Plastic drop-in bed liner $ 445,00 | $ 445.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 327.00
Extended warranty $ 3,015.00 | $ 3,015.00

3 1 % ton crew cab Ford F250 $ 53,294.50 | $ 53,294.50 |240 Days
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ - $ -
Running boards $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
Plastic drop in bed liner $ 445.00 | $ 445.00
Agate black camper shell $ 2,600.00 | $ 2,600.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 327.00
Extended warranty $ 3,505.00 | $ 3,505.00

4 1 % ton extended cab Ford F250 $ 48,999.50
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ - $ -
Running boards $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
Plastic drop in bed liner $ 445.00 | $ 445.00
4x4 $ 2,790.00 | $ 2,790.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 327.00
Extended Warranty $ 3,505.00 | $ 3,505.00

ltem # [Quantity Description Make/Model Unit Price Total Price Delivery (Days)

5 1 % ton extended cab Ford F250 $ 64,924.50 | $ 64,924.50 |240 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 327.00
Extended warranty $ 3,505.00 | $ 3,505.00

6 1 1 ton crew cab Ford F350 $ 56,794.50 | $ 56,794.50 |240 Days
OPTIONS:
Running boards $ 350.00 | $ 350.00
Spray in bed liner $ 575.00 | $ 575.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 327.00
Extended warranty $ 3,505.00 | $ 3,505.00

7 2 1 ton regular cab Ford F350 $ 71,599.50 | $ 143,199.00 (240 Days
OPTIONS:
Heavy duty alternator $ 325.00 | $ 650.00
Running boards $ 350.00 | $ 700.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 654.00
Extended warranty $ 3,505.00 | $ 7,010.00

8 1 Cargo Van Ford Transit $ 49,554.50
OPTIONS:
Invertor to charge cordless power tools $ 475.00 | $ 475.00
General service upfit package NO BID NO BID
Class 4 hitch $ 485.00 | $ 485.00
3rd set of keys $ 327.00 | $ 327.00
Extended warranty $ 3,305.00 | $ 3,305.00

ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGED

EXCEPTIONS






