BID #4361
Demolition

of Structures

Bid Opening: 1:00 PM September 14, 2023

OPENED BY:

Maddie Coleman

TABULATED BY: Kalyn Fox

Observers: Megan Mischel - First Impressions; David Johnson - R&S
Excavating; Mike Bridwell - A&S Services; Kim Gillim - Murphy Excavating;
Todd Morris - Morris & James; Beverley Clark - AIT Demo; Joe Sublett - City of

Owensboro; Stephen Franklin - City of Owensboro

TA Gaddis Yeiser Excavating Murphy Excavating First Impressions Morris & James R &S Excavating Spirtas
Item# [ Quantity [ Unit | Description
Demo per Specifications (Pricing per Location):

1 1 each 710 Dornell 8,400.00 8,175.00 | $ 10,000.00 | No Bid 6,500.00 5,900.00 | $ 8,500.00 | No Bid 11,500.00 | No Bid

2 1 each 1402 Hall 5,300.00 5,740.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 16,980.00 6,500.00 5,400.00 | $ 6,700.00 | $ 4,521.00 9,000.00 | No Bid

3 1 each 1700 Leitchfield 12,600.00 13,950.00 | $ 13,000.00 | No Bid 12,500.00 13,500.00 | $ 11,000.00 | No Bid 14,000.00 | No Bid

4 1 each 1701 Leitchfield 11,400.00 15,600.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 25,220.00 17,500.00 7,200.00 | $ 16,500.00 | $ 16,978.00 20,000.00 | No Bid

5 1 each 608 Poindexter 6,200.00 7,165.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 17,760.00 4,500.00 7,500.00 | $ 6,800.00 | $ 4,680.00 9,500.00 | No Bid

6 1 each 2024 W 5th 5,400.00 7,165.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 21,440.00 4,500.00 5,900.00 | $ 5,500.00 | $ 5,740.00 8,000.00 | No Bid

7 1 each 2309 W 8th 5,100.00 6,400.00 | $ 7,000.00 | No Bid 6,500.00 5,900.00 | $ 5,200.00 | $ 4,932.00 6,500.00 | No Bid

8 1 each 500 W 3rd Street 62,600.00 45,352.00 | $ 78,000.00 | $ 126,034.00 129,500.00 215,000.00 | $ 78,000.00 | No Bid 126,000.00 | $ 54,000.00

9 1 each 924 Locust Street 15,000.00 25,638.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 27,070.00 24,000.00 13,500.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 29,500.00 37,500.00 | No Bid

10 1 each 915 Cedar Street 5,100.00 6,900.00 | $ 8,000.00 | $ 16,440.00 4,500.00 6,900.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 4,850.00 12,500.00 | $ 8,500.00

11 1 each 917 Cedar Street 5,100.00 6,900.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 15,600.00 4,500.00 6,900.00 | $ 6,400.00 | $ 4,850.00 12,500.00 | $ 7,990.00
TOTAL of Items 1-11 142,200.00 148,985.00 | $ 181,000.00 | $ 266,544.00 221,000.00 293,600.00 | $ 175,800.00 | $ 76,051.00 267,000.00 | $ 70,490.00
Addendum Acknowledged Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Security Yes Yes No No Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes
Exceptions Listed None Yes None None None None None None None None
Subcontractors Listed None None None None None None None None None Yes

Rejected Bid - No Bid Security

Rejected Bid - No Bid

Security

Rejected Bid - No Bid Security




